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ACCESSING COUNCIL FACILITIES – 
VACCINATION REQUIREMENTS 

 
In line with Victorian Government 
requirements, as of 6:00pm Friday 29 
October 2021, community members will 
need to show proof of double 
vaccination to access Councils 
community facilities including swimming 
pools, Nhill Memorial Community 
Centre, community halls and Hindmarsh 
Shire Libraries in Dimboola, Jeparit, 
Nhill and Rainbow. You can do this via 
the Services Victoria app or with a 
printed Vaccination Certificate and 
photo ID. 
 
Children under 16, or those with an 
approved medical exemption, will still be 
able to access services. 
 
To assist our community who are unable 
to access library services in person, 
click and collect services are available 
along with e-books, e-audiobooks and 
e-magazines. Telephone your local 
Hindmarsh Shire Libraries branch to 
organise click and collect. 
 
At this stage, Council’s Customer 
Service Centre in Nhill does not require 
customers to be double vaccinated. 
Community members needing access 
to customer services in person, can 
attend the Nhill Customer Service 
Centre at 92 Nelson Street, Nhill.  
Online services are available on our 
website www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au or 
telephone 03 5391 4444 for assistance 
over the telephone. 
 

COVID-19 VACCINATION 
CERTIFICATE HELP 

 
Need a hand to download your digital 
vaccination certificate? Need a hand to 
set up your MyGov account? Just need 
a hand in general? 
 
Hindmarsh Shire Libraries are here to 
help. We will be running sessions 
across the Shire to provide you with 
some digital assistance around 
vaccination status. 
 
Simply book in a time by contacting your 
local branch and remember to bring 
your Medicare card, photo ID, phone 
and your email address and password. 

We can also assist you to set this up if 
required. 
 

Jeparit Library - 5391 4450 
Mondays from 10am - 12pm 

 
Dimboola Library - 5391 4452 
Wednesdays from 4pm - 6pm 

Fridays from 2pm - 4pm 
 

Nhill Library - 5391 4449 
Thursday from 2pm - 4pm 
Fridays from 2pm - 4pm 

 
Residents from Rainbow and surrounds 
can contact Alison from Rainbow 
Neighbourhood House on 0438 313 052 
for assistance. 
 
You don't have to do this on your own - 
we are here for you, helping you stay 
connected. 
 

SUBSCRIBE TO OUR E-NEWS 
 
To subscribe to our e-news visit 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/enews, or 
call us on 03 5391 4444 and we can do 
it for you! If you don’t have a computer 
or use email, we’d love to get you a hard 
copy – just ask! 
 

HAVE YOUR SAY 
 

YOUTH STRATEGY 2021-2025 
 
At the Council meeting held on 
Wednesday 20 October 2021, 
Hindmarsh Shire Council adopted the 
draft 2021-2025 Youth Strategy 
(English and Karen Versions) and is 
inviting community comment. 
 
Submissions in relation to the Youth 
Strategy 2021-2025 must be received 
before 5pm on Friday 19 November 
2021. 
 
To make a submission or for more 
information, please visit 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/have-your-
say.  
 

HUMAN RIGHTS POLICY 
 
At the Council meeting held on 
Wednesday 20 October 2021, 
Hindmarsh Shire Council resolved to 

make the draft Human Rights Policy 
available for public comment. 
 
Submissions in relation to the draft 
Human Rights Policy must be received 
before 5pm on Friday 19 November 
2021. 
 
To make a submission or for more 
information, please visit 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/have-your-
say. 
 

EVENTS 
 

2021 ANNUAL STATUTORY 
MEETING 

 
The Annual Statutory Meeting of 
Hindmarsh Shire Council will be held at 
6:00pm on Wednesday 10 November 
2021 at the Nhill Memorial Community 
Centre, 77-79 Nelson Street, Nhill. The 
purpose of the meeting is to elect a new 
Mayor, Deputy Mayor and appoint 
delegates to committees. 
 
This meeting is open to members of the 
public who are fully vaccinated and 
proof of double vaccination will be 
required upon entry.  
 
If you would like to attend, please RSVP 
to Shauna Johnson, Executive 
Assistant, on 03 5391 4444 or email 
EA@hindmarsh.vic.gov.au by 5:00pm 
Monday 8 November 2021. 
 
For those who are unable to attend, this 
meeting will be live streamed online via 
Council’s Facebook page at 
www.facebook.com/hindmarshshirecou
ncil.  
 
The next Ordinary Council Meeting will 
be held on Wednesday 24 November 
2021, commencing at 3pm. 
 
For more information on Council's 
meetings and to view past council 
meeting minutes and documents, 
please visit 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/council-
meetings.  
 
 
 
 
 

http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/enews
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/have-your-say
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/have-your-say
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SHREDABILITY SKATE 
WORKSHOPS AND COMPETITION 

 
WORKSHOPS 

Renton Millar from Shredability is 
bringing his skate skills to Hindmarsh 
from 12-14 November 2021! Renton will 
be hosting free skate lessons in 
Dimboola, Rainbow and Jeparit, 
followed by a comp in Nhill. The 
workshops times are  
 

Dimboola Skate Park - Workshop 
Friday 12 November 2021 

4:30 - 5:30pm 
5:30 - 6:30pm 

 
Rainbow Skate Park - Workshops 

Saturday 13 November 2021 
11 - 11:45am 

11:45am - 12:30pm 
 

Jeparit Skate Park - Workshops 
Saturday 13 November 2021 

2 - 2:45pm 
2:45 - 3:30pm 

 
To register for the free skate lessons, 
visit www.eventbrite.com.au/o/renton-
millar-29847640113 
 
In line with Victorian Government 
requirements, all attendees over 16 
years of age must be fully vaccinated 
and will need to show proof of double 
vaccination. 
 
If you have any questions, please give 
us a call on 03 5391 4444 or email 
youth@hindmarsh.vic.gov.au. 
 

 

COMPETITION 
The Shredability Skate Comp will be 
held at Jaypex Park on Sunday 14 
November 2021 from 11am-3pm. There 
will be a scooter, BMX and skate comp 
for junior (15 and under for BMX and 
scooter, 16 and under for skate) and 
senior (16 and up for BMX and scooter, 
17 and up for skate) age groups. 
Registration for the comp will be on the 
day, where you'll also need to have a 
parent/guardian fill out a consent form 
before you participate (if you're under 
18).  
 
We're running a bus from Rainbow, 
Jeparit and Dimboola too! If you're 
planning on coming on the bus, we'll 
need your parent or guardian to pre-fill 
both a Hindmarsh and Shredability 
consent form. These are both online 
forms and are available at 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/up-coming-
events.  
 
There will also be a BBQ and DJ to keep 
you fed and entertained! 
 
This event will be subject to the 
directives of the Chief Health Officer and 
all attendees over 16 years of age must 
be fully vaccinated and will need to 
show proof of double vaccination. If you 
do not agree or are unwilling to follow 
the current CHO directions, then please 
do not attend this event. Council has 
zero-tolerance for abuse towards staff. 
 
LEVEL UP GAMING EVENT – DATE 

CHANGE 
 
The Level-Up Gaming Event has had a 
date change! It will now be on Friday 3 
December 2021 from 5-9pm.  
 
The Level-Up Gaming Events team will 
be heading to Nhill Memorial 
Community Centre to run their much 
anticipated gaming event.  
 
They will be bringing an amazing variety 
of new and vintage consoles for you to 
try! Get ready for Mario-cart 
competitions, Minecraft adventures and 
mind-boggling Virtual Reality 
experiences. 
 
We will be running a bus from Rainbow, 
Jeparit and Dimboola too, so let us know 
if you need a ride! Book your place by 

visiting www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/up-
coming-events 
 
In line with Victorian Government 
requirements, all attendees over 16 
years of age must be fully vaccinated 
and will need to show proof of double 
vaccination. 
 

 
 

NHILL CINEMA 
 
Nhill Cinema will be screening a series 
of classic movies in the Nhill Memorial 
Community Centre, 77-79 Nelson 
Street, Nhill.  
 
 
FREE ENTRY | Morning tea provided 

prior to screenings 
 

Bookings are essential. In line with 
Victorian Government requirements, all 
attendees must be fully vaccinated and 
will need to show proof of double 
vaccination. Please call 03 5391 4444 to 
book your ticket. 
 

ON GOLDEN POND 
 

Tuesday 23 November 2021 
Morning Tea – 10am 

Film Screening – 10:30am 
 

JEDDA (RESCREENING) 
 

Jedda (rescreening) 
Tuesday 7 December 2021 

Morning Tea – 10am 
Film Screening – 10:30am 

 
OTHER NEWS 

 
COUNCIL SUPPORTS NHILL & 

DISTRICT HISTORICAL SOCIETY 
 
Hindmarsh Shire Council has decided to 
take on the role of Committee of 
Management for the old Lowan Shire 
Hall. This follows concerns from the 
Nhill and District Historical Society over 
the future of the building.  
 

http://www.eventbrite.com.au/o/renton-millar-29847640113
http://www.eventbrite.com.au/o/renton-millar-29847640113
mailto:youth@hindmarsh.vic.gov.au
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/up-coming-events
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/up-coming-events
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/up-coming-events
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/up-coming-events
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Council was approached by the Nhill 
and District Historical Society following 
a meeting held with a representative of 
DEWLP. The Society were concerned 
about the future of their building, with 
DEWLP indicating they do not have any 
funds to maintain the undertake 
maintenance works on the building. 
 
The building at 104-106 MacPherson 
Street Nhill was built in 1888 and was 
first occupied by the Lowan Shire 
Council following an official opening in 
early May 1888. Following the relocation 
of the Lowan Shire to the current 
Council office site at 92 Nelson Street in 
the 1960’s the building has been home 
to the Nhill and District Historical 
Society. 
 
Council will now work with DELWP to 
become the Committee of Management 
on the parcel, which could take up to 18 
months to be finalised. 
 
You can read more about this by visiting 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/news. 
 

  
 

MAYORAL MATTERS 
 

To read the latest 
from Hindmarsh Shire 
Council’s Mayor, Cr 
Ron Ismay, read the 
latest Mayoral Matters 
column on Council’s 
website. 
 
 

Visit: www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/news 
 

JEPARIT SWIMMING HOLE 
COMMUNITY CONVERSATION 

 
Following the easing of restrictions 
residents of Jeparit and district are 
invited to attend a community 

conversation with Hindmarsh Shire 
Council to obtain further information and 
to discuss the Wimmera River 
Discovery Trail Visitor Node.  

 
Date – Tuesday 16 November 2021 

Time – 5:00pm – 6:00pm 
Venue – Jeparit Tennis Clubrooms 

 
All interested residents are invited to 
attend this community conversation to 
learn more about the proposed works 
including upgrades to the retaining wall 
and proposed works and landscaping at 
the Jeparit Visitor Node of the Wimmera 
River Discovery Trail.  
 
In line with Victorian Government 
requirements, all attendees must be 
fully vaccinated and will need to show 
proof of double vaccination.   
 
For more information please contact 
Phil King, Economic and Community 
Development Manager on 03 
5391 4444 or via email to 
pking@hindmarsh.vic.gov.au. 
 

ALBACUTYA BRIDGE CLOSURE 
AND DEMOLITION 

 
Council has permanently closed the 
Albacutya Bridge after a condition 
inspection revealed the bridge is further 
deteriorating. This deterioration was 
likely accelerated due to the recent 
earthquake. 
 
All road users wishing to travel 
Albacutya Road past Outlet creek will 
now be required to use the gravel 
bypass by following the detour roadside 
traffic management signage. 
 
The closure will remain in place for 
several months whilst the replacement 
bridge is constructed. 
 
Demolition of the bridge is planned to 
occur in the first week of November. 
 

 

TOWN COMMITTEE MEMBERSHIP 
 
Are you a community minded person 
with great ideas for improving our 
towns? We are seeking expressions of 
interest from the community to join our 
Town Committees in Nhill, Jeparit, 
Dimboola and Rainbow. 
 
We are looking for people who want to 
help the Town Committees achieve their 
core purpose. If this is something you 
are interested in, please visit 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/advisory-
committees to find our more information 
or to apply. 
 
Applications are due to Council by 5pm 
on Wednesday 1 December 2021. 
Council will make the final appointments 
to the Town Committees at its meeting 
on Wednesday 15 December 2021. 
 

AUSTRALIA DAY AWARDS 2022 
 
The Australia Day Awards recognise 
outstanding community service to the 
Hindmarsh Shire community during the 
current year and/or given outstanding 
service to the community over a number 
of years. The awards are provided by 
the Australia Day Committee (Victoria) 
and are administered by Local 
Government Authorities throughout 
Australia 
 
Nominations for the 2022 Australia Day 
Awards are now open and being called 
for: 
• 2022 Citizen of the Year 
• 2022 Young Citizen of the Year 

 
To make a nomination, or to print an 
application form, please visit 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/australia-
day. 
 
Nomination forms can also be collected 
at any of our Customer Service Centres 
in Nhill, Dimboola, Rainbow and Jeparit. 
 
Nominations close at 5pm on Monday 
29 November 2021. 
 

DIMBOOLA MEAL RECIPIENTS 
NEED YOUR HELP 

 
Are you passionate about the Dimboola 
Community? Can you spare an hour? 

http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/news
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/news
mailto:pking@hindmarsh.vic.gov.au
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/advisory-committees
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http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/australia-day
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/australia-day
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Do you want to make a difference? 
 
Hindmarsh Shire Council is urgently 
seeking community minded people to 
volunteer weekdays to deliver Meals on 
Wheels. 
 
If you would like more information or 
wish to register as a volunteer, please 
contact Sharyn Salt or Kelsey Jensz on 
03 5391 4444. 
 

2022 YOUTH COUNCIL 
APPLICATIONS EXTENDED 

 

 
 
Nominations are now open for the 2022 
Hindmarsh Shire Youth Council. If you 
are enthusiastic about your friends and 
community, have great ideas, enjoy 
working with others and want to make a 
difference in your community; this is the 
right opportunity for you!  
 
Applications close at 5pm on Friday 26 
November 2021.  
 
For more information on how to apply, 
please visit Council’s website: 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/our-youth-
councillors  
 

FIRE PREVENTION INSPECTIONS 
 
Council's Municipal Fire Prevention 
Officers have commenced property Fire 
Inspections. Every property in the 
Hindmarsh Shire will be inspected for 
potential fire hazards in the front and 
rear yards.  
 
If you have concerns regarding 
vegetation on a particular property, you 
are welcome to contact Council on (03) 
5391 4444 to speak to a Local Laws 
team member. 
 

For more information about fire 
prevention, check out this link - 
www.cfa.vic.gov.au/about/who-does-
what.  
 

GRANTS 
 

BUSINESS ASSISTANCE GRANTS 
 
At its meeting on Wednesday 20 
October 2021, Hindmarsh Shire Council 
awarded local businesses grants from 
the first round of the Business 
Assistance Grants program for the 
2021/2022 financial year. 
 
Council will provide funding to thirteen 
local businesses totalling $30,836.20.  
 
To find out which businesses were 
successful, please visit 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/news.  
 

HINDMARSH YOUTH FREEZA 
GRANTS 

 
We received a number of exciting 
applications for the Hindmarsh Youth 
FReeZa grants that closed on 29 
October 2021. These applications will 
now be taken to the Youth Council 
meeting on 8 November 2021, for the 
Youth Councillors to assess.  
 
Applicants will be notified of their 
application outcome shortly after.  
 
Thank you to every young person who 
got involved! 
 
DROUGHT RESILIENCE FUNDING – 

ROUND 2 NOW OPEN 
 
Applications are now open for the 
second round of the Future Drought 
Fund's Networks to Build Drought 
Resilience Program.  
 
The program will continue to support the 
community organisations, networks and 
infrastructure that help people and 
communities prepare for drought. 
 
For more information on the Future 
Drought Fund and the Networks to Build 
Drought Resilience program 
visit www.agriculture.gov.au/ag-farm-
food/drought/future-drought-
fund/networks-build-drought-resilience 

 
Funding closes on 15 November 2021. 
 

PROJECT UPDATES 
 

AMENITIES UPGRADE AT NHILL 
CARAVAN PARK 

 
Stage 2 of the project to upgrade the 
Amenities building at the Nhill Caravan 
Park have now also been completed 
with the female facility completely 
refurbished.  
 
Just like the male facility block, new 
toilet and shower facilities, flooring, wall 
panelling and ceilings have been 
installed, providing future park guests 
with a fresh new bathroom experience. 
 

 
 

RAINBOW LIBRARY 
CONSTRUCTION UNDERWAY 

 
Building works at the Rainbow Library 
continue to progress, with the frame 
complete and the roof installed in the 
past week. Window frames have also 
been installed at the front and rear of the 
building.  
 
The next stage will see the bricklayer on 
site soon to commence construction of 
the external walls.  
 
Works are expected to be complete in 
early 2022. 
 

 

http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/our-youth-councillors
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/our-youth-councillors
http://www.cfa.vic.gov.au/about/who-does-what
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www.agriculture.gov.au/ag-farm-food/drought/future-drought-fund/networks-build-drought-resilience
www.agriculture.gov.au/ag-farm-food/drought/future-drought-fund/networks-build-drought-resilience
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RAINBOW LIBRARY LANDSCAPING 
 
The landscaping design for the new 
Rainbow Library has been completed 
and is currently being advertised for a 
Request For Quotation. Taking 
influences from the gardens at the 
Dimboola Library, the new park space at 
the rear of the Library will create a 
refreshing outdoor asset that will allow 
for community gatherings and activities 
to be staged at the rear of the library, 
which includes an open, elevated deck 
space. 
 
The next stage of this project will see the 
development of a concept design for a 
pathway through to The Oasis 
Community Hub, which will wind its way 
through existing and new shrubs and 
trees. The new Library garden and 
extended pathway are set to provide a 
link between Federal St and The Oasis. 
 

 
 

WIMMERA RIVER DISCOVERY 
TRAIL UPDATE 

 
In 2019 Hindmarsh Shire Council 
received funding from State and Federal 
Governments to implement the 
Dimboola to Lake Hindmarsh section of 
the Wimmera River Discovery Trail. 
Total funding for this stage is $1.2 
million, with $600,000 from the Federal 
Government’s Building Better Regions 
Fund being matched by $400,000 from 
the Victorian State Government and 
$200,000 from Hindmarsh Shire 
Council. 
 
The project is to deliver a 62km cycling 
and walking trail along the Wimmera 
River corridor between Dimboola and 
Lake Hindmarsh. The project includes: 
 
• Dimboola visitor node at the rear of 

the library leading track users to the 
Nine Creeks trails and onto the 
Wimmera River Discovery Trail 

• Jeparit visitor node at the 
‘swimming hole’ picnic area near 
the Caravan Park and Tennis 
Courts 

• Directional signage and 
formalisation of existing trails along 
the river corridor and, where 
necessary installing new sections 
of trail. 

• Pedestrian bridge across the 
Wimmera River at Jeparit 

 
To read an update on how this project is 
progressing and what is happening in 
the next stages, please visit 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/news.  
 

RAINBOW SILO ART PROJECT 
 

An innovative tourism project in 
Rainbow is gathering pace with the 
recent signing of a long term lease 
agreement and the appointment of a 
Project Manager. 
 
The new tourist attraction, unlike 
anything that has been seen before, will 
see a 34m high concrete grain silo 
transformed into a captivating, large 
scale internal and external art 
installation. 
 
You can read more about this project at 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/news. 
 

  
 

JEPARIT ELECTRIC VEHICLE 
CHARGING STATION 

 
Hindmarsh Shire Council is pleased to 
announce that another Electronic 
Vehicle Charging Station has been 
installed in Jeparit, in addition to the 
Dimboola Charging Station which was 
installed in September. It is located at 
Menzies Square in Jeparit. 
 
The charging stations at Dimboola and 
Jeparit have been chosen by Linga 
Network in partnership with Baidam 
Solutions due to the culturally significant 

areas in Dimboola and Jeparit. 
Dimboola was the first charging station 
to be installed as a part of guiding 
Electronic Vehicle drivers along a route 
named ‘Songlines by Baidam’.  This 
route in time will extend from Torquay to 
Port Fairy, and eventually across the 
border into South Australia. 
 
You can read more about this on 
Council's website here: 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/news.  
 

 
 

CONSTRUCTION WORKS 
 

FOOTPATH WORKS - QUEEN 
STREET NHILL  

 
Council has recently completed a 
section of footpath at Nhill College on 
Queen Street, Nhill. As this was 
previously only dirt, users will now be 
able to utilise a concrete path at the drop 
off area. 
 

 
 

CARPARK – NELSON STREET 
NHILL 

 
Council’s construction team has started 
upgrade works to the Nelson Street 
median car park (adjacent to Farmers 
Arms hotel) improving the drainage, 
sealed area and pathways. This aims to 
renew the area where the electric car 
charging station is installed. 
  
The construction team are also busy 
completing the K&C projects in 
Wimmera Street and Anderson Street 
Dimboola, being on track to finish in the 
next couple of weeks. 

http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/news
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/news
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/news
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TENDERS & OPPORTUNITIES 
 

CARAVAN PARK 
ACCOMMODATION UNITS 

 
Hindmarsh Shire Council is currently 
seeking tenders from suitably qualified 
and experienced persons/organisations 
for: 
 
• Design, construction, fit out and 

installation of up to six (6) 
demountable caravan park 
accommodation units - Contract 
no. 2021-2022-11 (re-advertised) 

 
The specific requirements are detailed 
in the tender documents, which can be 
downloaded via Council's tender portal. 
You can access this on our website at 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/search-
tenders  
 
Closing time for the above tender is 
2:00pm on Monday 8 November 2021. 
 
RAINBOW LIBRARY LANDSCAPING 

WORKS 
 
Hindmarsh Shire Council invites 
suitably qualified and experienced 
persons/organisations to respond to its 
Request for Quotation for: 
 
• Landscaping Works for Rainbow 

Library - Contract No. 2021-2022 – 
12 

 
The specific requirements are detailed 
in the Request for Quotation documents 
which can be found on our website 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/search-
tenders.  
 
Closing time for the above tender is 
2.00pm on Thursday 2 December 
2021.  
 
All enquiries should be directed to 
Simon Landrigan, Project Manager, via 
email to 
slandrigan@hindmarsh.vic.gov.au  or 
telephone (03) 5391 4444. 
 

WANT SOME PLANNING 
ADVICE? 

 
Thinking about buying a block of land, 

putting up a fence, removing some 
trees, building a new home or starting a 
new business?  It's a good idea to get 
some planning advice to find out if what 
you are proposing to do will require 
planning permission. 
  
There are a number of ways to seek this 
advice and the quality and quantity of 
information you provide to us may 
determine how quickly we can respond. 
  
You can phone our friendly customer 
service team and provide them with a 
property address (and assessment 
number), a brief description of what you 
are hoping to do, and as much relevant 
detail as you have available.  Please 
include your phone number and email (if 
you have one) for Council to get back to 
you.  
  
There are also online forms available. 
  
The “Request for Written Planning 
Advice” form is for those that are serious 
about the proposal they have for a 
particular property.  This form has a 
number of questions and a current copy 
of Title is required so Council can 
consider any restrictions that may apply 
to the property.  This form attracts a fee; 
however, a written response will be 
provided. 
  
For those with a more general enquiry, 
the “Developing in Hindmarsh” form can 
be used.  A specific address must be 
provided and advice will be of a general 
nature only as without a copy of Title, 
there may be restrictions affecting the 
property that Council is unaware of.  
Generally, a verbal response, rather 
than written, will be provided. 
  
The information provided by you may 
determine how long it takes for Council 
to respond. Responses may take 
between 48 hours to a week or so and 
complex enquiries may take a little 
longer to investigate. 
  
To view these forms or have a look at 
some planning information, please visit 
the Planning Permits and Services page 
on Council's website here: 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/planning-
permits-and-services.  
 
 

WORK FOR COUNCIL 
 

HEAVY PLANT OPERATOR / 
LABOURER – NHILL  

FULL TIME 
 
Hindmarsh Shire Council Infrastructure 
Team offers excellent working 
conditions, modern plant and 
equipment, a 9-day fortnight and above-
award pay rates.  
 
Join the Capital Works team and play an 
important role in improving civil 
infrastructure across the Shire. 
 
Construction Induction (White Card) 
training and a minimum Heavy Rigid 
endorsed driver licence essential.   
Traffic management and GPS grader 
operation experience would be highly 
regarded. 
 
Please contact Daniel Griffiths, 
Manager Capital Works, on 03 5391 
4444 for enquiries. 
 
Applications close Wednesday 10 
November 2021 at 12 noon and must 
address the key selection criteria as 
contained in the position description and 
application which is available on 
Council’s website here: 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/work-in-
council.  
 

ASSISTANT CARETAKER – 
RIVERSIDE HOLIDAY PARK, 

DIMBOOLA 
FULL TIME 

 
The Riverside Holiday Park in Dimboola 
is nestled under beautiful river gums 
alongside the Wimmera River.  Don’t 
miss the opportunity to work in this 
picturesque location! 
 
We are seeking a self-motivated person 
with outstanding customer service skills 
to assist in the general operation and 
maintenance of the Riverside Holiday 
Park, Dimboola.  
 
If you are an organised person with the 
ability to work independently to a high 
standard and enjoy contributing to a 
team, then this position could be for you. 
 
Part time or job share arrangements 

http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/search-tenders
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/search-tenders
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/search-tenders
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/search-tenders
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http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/planning-permits-and-services
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/planning-permits-and-services
http://www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/work-in-council
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may be considered for the right 
applicant. 
 
Please contact Angela Hoy, Director 
Infrastructure Services, on 03 5391 
4444 for enquiries. 
 
Applications close Wednesday 10 
November 2021 at 12 noon and must 
address the key selection criteria as 
contained in the position description and 
application which is available on 
Council’s website here: 
www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/work-in-
council. 
 

COMMUNITY CARE WORKER  
CASUAL 

 
This exciting role varies from client to 
client, with tasks ranging from personal 
care, meal preparation, hanging out 
washing, small group cooking lessons, 
shopping assistance and general house 
cleaning.  The aim is for clients to 
remain healthy, active and independent 
in their homes. 
 
If you enjoy working with people who 
need support, possess good time 
management skills and great 
communication skills, this may be the 
opportunity for you. 
 
Previous experience in Aged Care or a 
Certificate in Aged Care Studies is 
preferred but not essential. This casual 
role has varying hours per fortnight and 
would suit people looking at working 
during school hours. 
 
For further information about the role, 
contact Sharyn Salt, Community Care 
Services Coordinator on 03 5391 4444. 
 
Applications must address the key 
selection criteria as contained in the 
position description. This can be found 
on Council's website 
here www.hindmarsh.vic.gov.au/work-
in-council. 
 

JOBS AT YMCA – HINDMARSH 
SHIRE OUTDOOR POOLS 

 
YMCA Victoria have been awarded the 
contract for management of the four 
Hindmarsh Shire outdoor pools located 
in Nhill, Dimboola, Jeparit and Rainbow. 
 

They are interested in engaging with 
staff who have previously worked at 
these pools for the upcoming season 
and beyond. 
 
If you are interested, or know someone 
who may be interested, in a role at the 
pools this season, please contact Garry 
Salt, Hindmarsh Shire Council 
Coordinator Facilities and Environment 
on 03 5391 4444, or Jason Sheard, 
YMCA Victoria Area Manager, on 0432 
344 522 or email 
jason.sheard@ymca.org.au.  
 
For more information about jobs at 
YMCA, you can visit their website at 
www.victoria.ymca.org.au/staff-and-
volunteers/careers  

 
YOUR LIBRARY FROM HOME 

 
The Libraries Victoria app provides a 
clear and easy way to manage your 
library account. Browse the collection, 
make reservations, view and renew your 
loans, and more. 
 
To download this app, search Libraries 
Victoria in the Apple App Store or 
Google Play. 

 
OTHER LIBRARY APPS 

 
Libby 

1. Download the Libby 
app 
2. Find Hindmarsh Shire 
Libraries 
3. Enter your library 

card 
4. Borrow a title and start reading 
5. Borrow eBooks, eAudiobooks and 
eMagazines 
 

It’s as simple as that! 
 

 
BorrowBox 

1. Install the BorrowBox 
app 
2. Select Hindmarsh 
Shire Libraries 
3. Activate with your 

library membership card 
4. Borrow eBooks and eAudiobooks 

 
Need a hand? 

Ask one of your friendly library staff! 

FIND US ON FACEBOOK AND 
INSTAGRAM 

 
Hindmarsh Shire Council 

www.facebook.com/hindmarshshirecouncil  
 

Hindmarsh Shire Libraries 
www.facebook.com/hindmarshshirelibraries  

Instagram: @hindmarshshirelibraries 
 

Hindmarsh Shire Youth Council 
www.facebook.com/hindmarshshireyouthco

uncil  
Instagram: @hsyouthcouncil 

 
Visit Hindmarsh 

www.facebook.com/visithindmarsh  
Instagram: @visithindmarsh 

 
Early Years Hindmarsh 

www.facebook.com/early.years.520  
 

SUPPORT SERVICES 
 
Are you struggling following the latest 
lockdown? There are many ways to 
support other people, or be supported if 
you are feeling anxious or uncertain. 
  
Below are support services available: 
• Lifeline Australia | Ph: 13 11 14 | 

www.lifeline.org.au  
• Beyond Blue | Ph: 1300 224 636 | 

www.beyondblue.org.au  
• Kids Helpline | Ph: 1800 551 800 | 

www.kidshelpline.com.au  
A free, private and confidential 24/7 
phone and online counselling service 
for young people aged 5 to 25 years. 

• Rural Outreach Program | Ph: 1300 
688 732 

• Eheadspace | Ph: 1800 650 893 | 
www.headspace.org.au/eheadspace/  
Online and web chat support and 
counselling for people aged 12 - 25 
years, their family and friends. 
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